
Chart 1: Top 25 Growth Rates (%) 
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  For only the second time in the past
11 years, combined revenue for the
Top 25 contract manufacturers (EMS
providers and ODMs) failed to grow
in 2013. Last year, Top 25 revenue
totaled $342.1 billion, down 0.5%
from 2012 (Chart 1). Since the Top 25
accounts for 80% to 90% of revenue in
the outsourcing space, this downward
tick in revenue serves as an approxi-
mate indicator of how the contract
manufacturing market behaved in 2013.

  Perhaps more disappointing than
the lack of growth was the realization
that the Top 25 as a whole did not
keep up with the global economy,
which grew at a 3% rate in 2013,
according to the International Mone-
tary Fund. The Top 25’s underperfor-
mance says something about the
contract manufacturing space: it can
no longer be relied on to outgrow the
global economic baseline. In 2013,
new contract manufacturing business
was not enough to increase revenue in
the outsourcing space, leaving no
doubt that the space has reached a
state of maturity in which outsourcing
penetration of end markets, especially
the traditional ones, has left the space
more dependent on, and some would
say vulnerable to, end market demand.
Last year made it clear that softness
among end markets along with revenue
losses from products at end of life and
cost reductions can offset gains from
new programs.

Slight Slippage for Top 25 in 2013
  Annual sales

growth for the Top
25 over the last 11
years has averaged
14.4%. But annual
results for the past
two years haven’t
been anywhere near
double digits, much
less at that level.
Once again, the
question arises: Are
the days of double-
digit growth now behind the Top 25
and, by extension, the contract manu-
facturing sector? At least one market
forecast suggests that mid single-digit
increases will be the new norm (see
article on p. 7).

EMS providers outgrow ODMs

  The Top 25 contract manufacturers
for 2013 consist of 17 companies
whose primary business is EMS – de-
fined here as EMS providers – and
eight companies that mainly rely on

ODM work – classified as ODMs. In
2013, the EMS group outgrew the
ODM side by 6.7 percentage points.
Combined revenue for the EMS pro-
viders increased by just 1.6%, but
sales on the ODM side dropped by
5.1% (Chart 2, p. 3). It’s no surprise
that 2013 was a tough year overall for
the ODM group given its reliance on
the PC market and the market’s worst-
ever decline in 2013.

  For 2013, EMS providers contrib-
uted 70.2% of Top 25 sales, up from
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59.9% in 2012. The primary reason for
the share gain was the reclassification
of Pegatron from ODM to EMS pro-
vider. MMI has learned that a clear
majority of Pegatron’s contract manu-
facturing sales come from EMS. Com-
bined revenue on the EMS side
amounted to $240.2 billion, while the
ODM cohort brought in sales of
$101.9 billion, or 29.8% of the total.

  As shown in Table 1 on this page,
MMI ranked the Top 25 contract man-
ufacturers in order of calendar 2013
sales in US dollars. It was significantly
easier to make the 2013 edition of the
Top 25 than to join the previous year’s
version. A place in the Top 25 re-
quired a minimum of $810 million,
$96 million below the 2012 cutoff of
$906 million. Sales declines among
the bottom ranks of the Top 25 result-
ed in a lowering of the cutoff. Interest-
ingly, the cutoff has dropped for three
consecutive years following 2010
(Chart 3, p. 3). Indeed, it’s somewhat
counterintuitive that entering the Top
25 has become progressively easier
over the last three years, but that is
what the data show. On the other hand,
the barrier to entry will fall if there are
sales declines at the bottom of the pre-
vious year’s Top 25 and any replace-
ments haven’t grown enough to
support the prior year’s cutoff. To
MMI, this progressive easing of the
cutoff indicates that in the $800 mil-
lion to $1 billion range not enough
CMs have been growing.

  At $133.2 billion in sales for 2013,
Hon Hai Precision Industry again
stood unchallenged atop the Top 25.
The company’s share of Top 25 reve-
nue continued to increase in 2013,
reaching 38.9% for a gain of 110 basis
points year over year. But unlike the
previous three years when Hon Hai
gave Top 25 growth a substantial
boost, in 2013 Hon Hai’s effect was
minimal. Last year, revenue for the 24
companies excluding Hon Hai fell by
1.2% from a year earlier versus a de-
crease of 0.5% for the entire group.

Hence, Hon Hai narrowed the Top 25
decline by just 70 basis points.

  Not only did Hon Hai remain in

first place, but the Top 25 order from
second to eighth was also unchanged
from 2012. Quanta Computer held

3102rofsrerutcafunaMtcartnoC52poT:1elbaT

noitazinagrO sretrauqdaeH

selaS
radnelac
3102
)$SUM(

3102
ybknar
latot

selas

2102
knar

selaS
radnelac
2102
)$SUM(

selaS
htworg
31'-21'

ssenisuB
ledom

iaHnoH
yrtsudnInoisicerP
)nnocxoF(

,iepiaTweN
nawiaT

622,331$ 1 1 362,231$ %1 /MDO/SME
-moc/lennahc
rehto/stnenop

retupmoCatnauQ ,nahsieuG
nawiaT,nauyoaT

676,92$ 2 2 196,43$ %41- MBO/MDO

nortageP 1 nawiaT,iepiaT 539,82$ 3 3 169,52$ %11 MDO/SME
scinortxelF eropagniS 086,42$ 4 4 446,42$ %0 -opmoc/SME

stnen
lapmoC

scinortcelE 2
nawiaT,iepiaT 843,32$ 5 5 151,32$ %1 MDO

nortsiW nawiaT,uhcnisH 420,12$ 6 6 462,22$ %6- /SME/MDO
MBO

tiucriClibaJ 3 ,grubsreteP.tS
LF

113,81$ 7 7 264,71$ %5 /SME
slairetam

cetnevnI nawiaT,iepiaT 835,51$ 8 8 319,31$ %21 MDO
opniKweN

puorG 2
,iepiaTweN
nawiaT

546,6$ 9 01 436,6$ %0 MDO/SME

ygolonhceTVPT 4 nawiaT,iepiaT 393,6$ 01 9 286,6$ %4- MBO/MDO
animnaS AC,esoJnaS 078,5$ 11 21 680,6$ %4- -opmoc/SME

MDO/stnen
acitseleC adanaC,otnoroT 697,5$ 21 11 705,6$ %11- SME
adsiQ ,nahsieuG

nawiaT,nauyoaT
810,4$ 31 31 449,3$ %2 SME/MDO

kramhcneB
scinortcelE

XT,notelgnA 605,2$ 41 51 864,2$ %2 SME

afiaKnehznehS
ygolonhceT

anihC,nehznehS 034,2$ 51 41 085,2$ %6- MDO/SME

lasrevinU
cifitneicS
)ISU(lairtsudnI

anihC,iahgnahS 303,2$ 61 71 011,2$ %9 MDO/SME

suxelP IW,haneeN 822,2$ 71 61 803,2$ %3- SME
erutneV eropagniS 568,1$ 81 91 809,1$ %2- MDO/SME
scinortcelECMU napaJ,amatiaS 392,1$ 91 32 180,1$ %02 SME
XIIS napaJ,akasO 042,1$ 02 12 473,1$ %01- SME
kinortkelErenlloZ
puorG

ynamreG,tdnaZ 081,1$ 5 12 22 801,1$ %7 SME

NARTmA
ygolonhceT

,ytiCeHgnohC
nawiaT

499$ 22 81 252,1$ %12- MBO/MDO

esirpretnEytilibA nawiaT,iepiaT 009$ 32 02 964,1$ %93- MDO

scinortimuS napaJ,oykoT 148$ 42 52 609$ %7- SME
scinoyeB
ygolonhceT

eropagniS 018$ 52 -nruter
ee

069$ 61- -opmoc/SME
stnen

.gva/latoT 050,243$ 627,343$ %5.0-
tsrifehtybdetacidnisaMDOroSMEsadeifissalcerewsessenisubelpitlumhtiwseinapmoC

mynorca yreveerutpacottnaemtonerasnoitpircsedledoM.noitpircsedledomssenisubehtni
oF.eusrupthgimynapmocassenisub otni$TNgnitrevnoc,iaHnoHdnasMDOdesab-nawiaTr

.atadevreseRlaredeFSUnodesabsetaregnahcxeylretrauqegarevagnisuenodsaw$SU
1 .ssenisubSMDerocs'nortagePotdnopserrocselaS 2 .puorGopniKehtforebmemA

3 tahtssenisubsecivrestekramretfanaedulcnidnarebmevoNotrebmeceDmorferaselaS
.4102nidetsevidsaw 4 detneserperhcihw,ssenisubMDOs'VPTotdnopserrocselaS

.3102niselaslatots'VPTfo%4.35 5 .erugifselasyranimilerP



Chart 3: Top 25 Cutoff (Millions USD)
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on to second place, followed by Pega-
tron, Flextronics, Compal Electron-
ics, Wistron, Jabil and Inventec in
that order. New Kinpo Group moved
up one position to ninth, while TPV
Technology saw its rank drop from
ninth to tenth. TPV’s downward move
resulted from a change in the way its
sales were counted. For the 2012 list,
TPV was ranked based on total sales,
which included a substantial amount of
own-brand sales; for 2013, only its
ODM sales (53.4% of the total) were
used for ranking.

  There was only one change in the
makeup of the 2013 Top 25 when
compared with the previous year’s ver-

sion. A spot on the 2013 list opened
up when ODM Accton Technology, a
Top 25 member in 2012, failed to
qualify because of a sales decline. The
Accton departure allowed Beyonics
Technology to return to the Top 25
after a two-year absence.

  Sales were flat or down at 15 CMs,
with six of them enduring double-digit
declines (Table 1, p. 2). Still, nine
players moved up in the standings, as
EMS provider UMC Electronics
climbed the farthest — an ascent of
three places. It was no coincidence
that UMC also achieved the highest
sales growth at 20%.

  Editor’s note:  The EMS-versus-

ODM analysis presented here does not
allow for the fact that some companies
pursue both EMS and ODM business.

  The Top 25’s sales of $342.1 bil-
lion were not all derived from EMS
and ODM work. As shown in Table 1
on page 2, some companies mix in
revenue from other businesses such as
components and own-brand manufac-
turing. To some degree, Top 25 sales
and growth figures have been influ-
enced by revenue from businesses
outside the realm of contract manufac-
turing. There may be cases where the
addition of other business to contract
manufacturing revenue might have un-
fairly boosted a provider’s rank.

New Analysis of
Market Segments

  MMI has completed its latest analy-
sis of EMS market segments by utiliz-
ing data from its annual Top 50
survey. Data from 40 of the MMI Top
50™ EMS providers show that nontra-
ditional areas comprised the largest
source of combined revenue for these
players in 2013. The nontraditional
segments – industrial/commercial,
medical, automotive, defense/security/
aerospace and other – together repre-
sented 34%, or just over one third, of
the providers’ total sales of $63.7 bil-
lion (Chart 1A, p. 5). In a similar anal-
ysis of Top 50 data for 2012, the
nontraditional areas also claimed the
biggest share of total revenue (April

2013, p. 3). For many providers, non-
traditional areas continue to be the
most productive segments for their
business development efforts.

  The attraction of the nontraditional
areas can be seen in the popularity of
the industrial segment, which drew 37
out of 40 providers. No other segment
in this analysis came close to getting
that many votes.

  Market segment percentages for the
40 Top 50 EMS providers appear in
Table 1A on pages 4 and 5. Percentag-
es came directly from the providers’
responses to the Top 50 survey. Ten
companies in the Top 50 either did not
provide a breakdown of their sales by
market segment or supplied data in-
consistent with MMI’s categories.

  Communications infrastructure took

the second largest share of the 40 pro-
viders’ aggregate sales in 2013. The
comm infrastructure segment account-
ed for 27.3% of combined sales. One
company, Fabrinet, obtained more
than 70% of its sales from the seg-
ment, while two others, Flextronics
and Celestica, derived more than 40%
of their sales from the segment.

  The final two segments were nearly
equal in the amount of business they
attracted. Computing and storage gar-
nered 19.6% of total revenue, while
consumer electronics, mobile phones
and other high-velocity products ac-
counted for 19.1%.

  For 18 providers out of 40, comput-
ing and storage was a segment to
avoid, which is no surprise. Much of
the outsourcing in the computing and
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storage space is controlled by the EMS
giant Hon Hai, number-two EMS pro-
vider Pegatron, and the ODMs. Their
considerable presence in the space
shrinks the amount of business avail-
able to other EMS providers and even
more so for those who eschew high
volumes. Still, some providers have
carved out niches for themselves with-
in the space. For example, six provid-
ers, all based in Asia, gained more
than half of their revenue from com-
puting and storage, and three of them –
Shenzhen Kaifa Technology, Global
Brands Manufacture and SMT
Technologies – depended on the seg-
ment for more than 70% of their busi-
ness (Table 1A).

  Consumer electronics, mobile
phones and other high-velocity prod-
ucts make up another segment that a
significant number of Top 50 provid-
ers stay away from. Of the 40 Top 50
providers in this analysis, 15 steer
clear of this high-velocity segment. Of
course, providers that follow a lower-
volume, high-mix strategy, which is
common among players below the top
tier, want no part of the high-volume
work required in this space. Still, three
providers – Universal Scientific In-
dustrial, V.S. Industry and Compu-
time – generated more than half of
their revenue from the high-velocity
segment.

  Although 2013 was a year of barely
discernible growth for the Top 50, the
same cannot be said for the four main
areas based on results of this analysis.
To see which areas grew which did
not, MMI performed an apples-to-ap-
ples comparison by using market seg-
ment data from 36 companies that
were present in both the 2012 and
2013 analyses.

  After combining the segment data
from the 36 providers for both years,
analysis showed that two sectors
gained revenue in 2013 versus the pri-
or year and two sectors saw lower
sales last year. The nontraditional and
high-velocity sectors were the winners
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Chart 1A: Market Mix for 40 Top 50 EMS Providers in 2013 
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in this comparison, while the comput-
ing and storage and communications
infrastructure segments were on the
losing end.

  For the 36 providers as a whole,
2013 sales from the nontraditional seg-
ments (plus “other”) rose 5.4%, well
above the group’s average growth of
0.6%. The above-average growth of
the nontraditional areas probably indi-
cates a greater abundance of new out-
sourcing opportunities in those areas,
which tend to be less penetrated than
the more mature computing and stor-
age and comm infrastructure segments.
In this comparison, the nontraditional
areas picked up 150 basis points of
market share in 2013, which increased
their share to a leading 33.7% (Table
2A, below).

  Revenue from consumer electron-
ics, mobile phones and other high-ve-
locity products grew at a slightly lower
rate than was observed for the nontra-
ditional areas. High-velocity business
advanced 4.5%, perhaps a somewhat
pleasant surprise in light of slower-
than-expected overall growth in world
markets. And yet, demand for consum-
er products in China and other devel-
oping countries continues unabated,
giving this segment a built-in engine
for growth. The high-velocity share of
the group’s sales was 18.9%, up 70
basis points from 2012.

  In this comparison, sales from the
communications infrastructure seg-
ment declined 3.6% from 2012, a not
unexpected result in that end market
demand in general did not catch fire in
2013. The segment lost 120 basis
points of market share in 2013, which
brought its share down to 27.7%.

  Finally, computing and storage rev-
enue fell 4.2% from a year earlier,
while giving up 100 basis points of
market share. Those EMS providers
who did business in the PC market had
to contend with a decline in PC ship-
ments, which Gartner put at -10% for
2013. In addition, the high-perfor-
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mance technical server market was
down 7.2% last year, according to
IDC.

  The three top-tier providers in this
analysis contributed 58% of total
sales. As a result, these three providers
heavily influenced market segment
results for the entire group of 40. What
do the market segments look like for
providers below the top tier? When
these three companies were excluded
along with three others whose nontra-
ditional categories did not correspond
with MMI’s, a different picture emerg-
es. For the remaining 34 EMS provid-
ers with sales under $3 billion, the
nontraditional areas overall take on
greater importance. In 2013, the non-
traditional segments (plus other) ac-
counted for 48.8% of the combined
revenue of those 34 providers. This
result is consistent with a 2012 analy-
sis of 36 providers, in which the non-
traditional areas captured a nearly
identical share of 49.0% (April 2013,
p. 6). If these results can be extrapolat-
ed to the industry at large, then it can

be said that the nontraditional seg-
ments supply nearly half of the reve-
nue for providers below the top tier.

  Data from providers below $3 bil-
lion in sales show how the individual
segments within the nontraditional cat-
egory break down for them. For this
subgroup of 34 Top 50 EMS provid-
ers, the industrial/commercial area fur-
nished more revenue than any other
segment, nontraditional or otherwise.
The industrial/commercial segment
represented 26.6% of total sales,
dwarfing the other nontraditional seg-
ments (Chart 2A, p. 5). Industrial/com-
mercial also came out number one in
the 2012 analysis of 36 providers
(April 2013, p. 5). Again, if these re-
sults can be generalized, then the in-
dustrial/commercial segment has
become the number-one revenue pro-
ducer for providers below the top tier.

  Next in size among the nontradi-
tional areas was the automotive seg-
ment with 8.6% of revenue. Growth of
the global auto industry in 2013 proba-
bly contributed to the automotive

share, which was 140 basis points
higher than in the 2012 analysis. Close
behind the automotive segment was
the medical segment with an 8.0%
share, unchanged from the 2012 analy-
sis. Over the past four years of analy-
sis, the medical share has ranged from
7.8% to 8.1%, evidence that medical
business is not gaining market share
despite the emphasis that many provid-
ers have placed on this segment. Busi-
ness from the defense/security/aero-
space segment came in at 4.3% of total
sales, showing once more that this
business is significantly smaller than
the automotive or medical segments, at
least for Top 50 providers below the
industry’s first tier. Other business that
could not be categorized fell into the
smallest segment, which claimed a
share of 1.3% (Chart 2A).

  Editor’s note: This analysis cov-
ered providers who sometimes differ
as to which products go in what cate-
gories. As a result, there is some un-
certainty with respect to the results
presented here.

Some Quarterly Results
  Jabil. For its fiscal Q2 ended Feb.

28, revenue totaled $3.58 billion,
down 18% sequentially and 14% year
over year. The company reported non-
GAAP EPS of $0.10, compared with
$0.43 in the prior quarter and $0.45 in
the year-ago period. Revenue was
slightly below the midpoint of guid-
ance, while non-GAAP EPS landed at
the midpoint.

  GAAP operating income for fiscal
Q2 amounted to $3.6 million, or 0.1%
of revenue, versus $133.0 million, or
3.2% of revenue, in the year-ago quar-
ter. Jabil recorded a GAAP net loss
attributable to shareholders of $38.7
million, or a loss of $0.19 a share,
compared with net income of $88.5
million, or $0.43 a share, in the year-
earlier period. Included in the net loss
were restructuring and related charges
of $36 million.

  Non-GAAP operating margin came

in at 1.7%, down 200 basis points se-
quentially and 190 basis points year
over year. Non-GAAP operating in-
come was $60.4 million, down from
$159.7 million in the prior quarter and
$151.5 million a year earlier.

  Diversified Manufacturing Services
revenue (43% of total sales) dropped
16% year over year in line with guid-
ance. The decline mainly stemmed
from a lack of demand from a custom-
er in Jabil’s Materials Technology
unit, as previously discussed (Jan., p.
4). Non-GAAP operating margin for
the DMS segment stood at 1.8%.

  Enterprise and Infrastructure busi-
ness (34% of sales) fell 9% from a
year earlier, reflecting declines in en-
terprise spending seen late in the quar-
ter. The E&I segment produced a
non-GAAP operating margin of 2.5%.

  Revenue from Jabil’s High Veloci-
ty segment (23% of sales) decreased
18% year over year, mainly due to the

company’s BlackBerry disengage-
ment. The segment’s non-GAAP oper-
ating margin was 0.3%.

  For the second straight quarter, free
cash flow went negative as cash flow
from operations was $17 million, and
capital expenditures totaled $76 mil-
lion. For fiscal 2014, Jabil is now esti-
mating free cash flow at $150 million
to $250 million, down from an earlier
projection of $400 million to $500
million (Jan., p. 3-4).

  For fiscal Q3 ending in May, Jabil
expects revenue to decline about 14%
year over year to within a range of
$3.5 billion to $3.7 billion. Fiscal Q3
guidance also includes non-GAAP op-
erating income of $20 million to $60
million, non-GAAP operating margin
of 0.6% to 1.6%, non-GAAP EPS of
minus $0.20 to $0.00 a share, and
GAAP EPS of $0.74 to $1.04 a share.
The prediction for GAAP EPS reflects
the sale of the company’s aftermarket
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services business (see News, p. 8).
Jabil believes Q3 will be the turning
point for operating income levels.

  On a year-over-year basis, the com-
pany is forecasting DMS sales to be
flat, E&I revenue to decrease 5%, and
High Velocity business to drop 40%.
The High Velocity decline reflects the
wind down of Jabil’s BlackBerry rela-
tionship.

  Jabil believes it will deliver non-
GAAP EPS of $1.65 to $1.95 in fiscal
2015.

  Plexus. For its fiscal Q2 ended
March 29, the company reported reve-
nue of $558 million, up 4% from the
prior quarter and flat versus the year-
ago period. Non-GAAP EPS stood at
$0.60, down 2% sequentially but up
15% year over year. Revenue came in
above the midpoint of its guidance
range, while non-GAAP EPS matched
the midpoint of guidance for that EPS
metric.

  The company earned GAAP net
income of $18.5 million, compared
with $17.7 million in the prior quarter
and $18.0 million a year earlier.
GAAP EPS of $0.53 gained 4% se-
quentially and 2% year over year. The
GAAP EPS result included a negative
$0.18 a share of restructuring and im-
pairment charges, partly offset by
$0.11 a share of discrete tax benefit.

  Networking/Communications sales
were flat sequentially, exceeding ex-
pectations. Plexus’ Healthcare/Life
Sciences sector grew 1% quarter to
quarter, in line with expectations. In-
dustrial/Commercial business in-
creased 7% from the prior quarter, a
result that was below expectations.
The company’s Defense/Security/
Aerospace sector was up 20% sequen-
tially, but this performance also fell
short of expectations.

  Gross margin for fiscal Q2 came in
at 9.5%, down 10 basis points sequen-

tially but up 20 basis points year over
year. In line with guidance, non-GAAP
operating margin was 4.5%, down 30
basis points sequentially but up 30 ba-
sis points year over year.

  Guidance for fiscal Q3 (the June
quarter) calls for revenue of $600 mil-
lion to $630 million and non-GAAP
EPS of $0.69 to $0.74. The midpoint
of revenue guidance suggests sequen-
tial sales growth of about 10%. Plexus
expects a non-GAAP operating margin
of 4.6% to 4.8%.

  On a sequential basis, the company
is projecting growth of more than 20%
for Networking/Communications, a
low to mid single-digit increase for
Healthcare/Life Sciences, high single-
digit growth for Industrial/Commer-
cial, and a mid single-digit rise in rev-
enue for Defense/Security/Aerospace.

  The company said its outlook for
fiscal 2014 had improved modestly
during fiscal Q2.

IDC’s Latest Forecast
  Market research firm IDC has put

out a new forecast for the contract
manufacturing space, consisting of the
EMS and ODM sectors. The firm’s
latest projections show that contract
manufacturing revenue will exceed
$500 billion by 2018.

  IDC is predicting that contract man-
ufacturing sales will rise from $390.2
billion in 2012 to $517.4 billion in
2018. According to the forecast, the
contract manufacturing business grew
3.0% last year to $401.7 billion. For
2014, IDC foresees the growth rate

increasing modestly to 5.2%, which
will bring the total of EMS and ODM
sales to $422.5 billion. For the years
2015 through 2018, the forecast calls
for annual growth rates between 4.9%
and 5.5%. With projected annual
growth rates from 2013 to 2018 in the
vicinity of 5%, it’s no wonder then that
the five-year CAGR for that period
works out to 5.2%, reflecting a busi-
ness that has reached the mature stage
(Table 1B, below).

  The EMS industry, however, is ex-
pected to grow somewhat faster than
that. It’s CAGR from 2013 to 2018 is
6.4%, based on the IDC forecast. After

a nearly flat 2013 when EMS revenue
amounted to an estimated $240.3 bil-
lion, the EMS industry is expected to
pick up steam this year. IDC is pro-
jecting that EMS revenue will grow by
8.9% in 2014 to $261.6 billion.
Growth in subsequent years will range
from 5.5% to 6.5%, with 2015 at the
high end of the range. The firm is fore-
casting that the EMS business will
cross the $300-billion mark in 2017,
ending up at $328.2 billion in 2018
(Table 1B).

  IDC’s outlook for the ODM sector
is not as bright. Forecast data from
2013 to 2018 for the ODM side yield
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an ODM CAGR of 3.2%, exactly half
of the comparable EMS rate. Annual
growth rates for the ODM sector are
forecasted lower than those of the
EMS industry every year from 2014 to
2018, with 2014 showing the greatest
difference (Table 1B, p. 7). While IDC
has the EMS industry expanding at an
8.9% clip in 2014, ODM revenue is
predicted to shrink slightly by 0.3% to
$161.0 billion.

  But IDC estimates that the tables
were turned in 2013, when the ODM
side outgrew the EMS sector by 8 per-
centage points. Last year when EMS
sales were essentially flat, ODM reve-
nue increased by an estimated 7.9% to
$161.5 billion, according to IDC.

  By 2018, ODM revenue is forecast-
ed reach $189.2 billion, or 36.6% of
the contract manufacturing market.
The ODM sector will lose 3.6 percent-
age points of market share over the
period 2013 to 2018, IDC predicts.

News

  Two German EMS providers are
targeted for acquisition…Scanfil
EMS (Sievi, Finland) has purchased
EMS provider Schaltex Systems of
Schenefeld, Germany, while Neways
Electronics International (Son, The
Netherlands) has signed a letter of in-
tent to acquire family-owned BuS
Group, an EMS provider based in

Riesa, Germany.
  Scanfil is paying about 6.6 million

euros for Schaltex, which brought in
sales of 20.8 million euros in 2013 and
employs a staff of 80. Scanfil, which
did not have a production site in Ger-
many, said the Schaltex deal strength-
ens the provider’s position in the
German market and widens Scanfil’s
customer base.

  Similarly, Neways’ prospective
acquisition of BuS Group will signifi-
cantly strengthen Neways’ footprint
in the German EMS market, said
Neways. The company has an existing
operation in Neunkirchen, Germany.
BuS Group utilizes a workforce of
about 900, generates annualized sales
of around 106 million euros, and oper-
ates in Germany and the Czech Repub-
lic. The price for acquiring BuS Group
was not disclosed.

  Divestiture completed…Jabil (St.
Petersburg, FL) has completed the sale
of its aftermarket services business to
iQor Holdings for $725 million sub-
ject to closing adjustments and other
items (Dec. 2013, p. 1-2).

  Correction…Upon further review
of Top 50 data, MMI determined that
the Top 50 sales figure used for Spar-
ton – $241 million – included intra-
company sales that should have been
eliminated. When intracompany sales

are taken out, Sparton’s EMS sales
become $224 million, which is the fig-
ure that should have been used for Top
50 ranking. As a result, Sparton drops
to 50th position, and the Top 50 cutoff
is lowered to $224 million.

  In addition, SMTC released its
2013 sales in April after the MMI Top
50 was published. For the record,
SMTC’s actual sales were $271 mil-
lion versus an estimate of $268 million
used for the Top 50. SMTC’s actual
sales increased overall revenue per
employee ratios slightly by about $100.


